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 Established Elite Interior design had always remained 
keenly attuned to the pulse of changing industry trends
governed by today’s sophisticated world. This enabled Elite to 
enjoy year on year growth to become recognized as one of 
the most sought-after contracting company in the UAE. With 
a simple philosophy of pleasing design coupled with secure 
technical detailing, Elite enjoys producing interiors ranging 
from small scale retail extensions to palatial residences and 
five-star hospitality projects. Along with the latest technology 
and trends in interior design. Elite ability to interpret design 
concepts to produce unique & dramatic interiors, is well 
renowned throughout. Hard work and excellent client
communication have made, and continue to make 
Elite interior One of the most trusted names in the interior 
contracting business. For more than two decades, Elite interi-
or has been successfully providing the service, a Full range of 
planning, interior design and fit-out services

 Our extensive and varied experience in design
conceptualizing as well as complete turnkey fit-out work such 
as corporate office facilities, strategic facility planning and
interior project management, are the main factors that have 
contributed greatly to Elite steady growth.

Introduction

2



Imagination is understood as an actual space or medium in 
an individual's mind, which has the ability to combine images 
and ideas to do the work of the mind. As a medium,
imagination is a world in which thought and images are
intertwined in the mind to form a mental perception of what 
the senses actually do not have. We at Elite are committed to 
transforming these creative and imaginative concepts of 
designers into interior designs that reflect precision.
As Elite's interior design has grown, so has its staff. Elite has a 
dedicated and professional team, focused on meeting the 
client's needs as well as maintaining high levels of quality and 
performance. All projects are executed to high quality
standards with following the high safety roles, The success 
and growth of the elite lies in the power of teamwork.
We share the same strategies and encourage the exchange of
creative ideas and best practices, all done under strict quality 
control. Strong collaborative relationships and group thinking 
breed innovation.

Elite is the answer to all the infinite possibilities of reality

Professional Vision
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Promising to provide high quality services is our philosophy. 
Elite specializes in turnkey interior design to the highest 
industry standards where meticulous attention to detail is 
taken from wall to wall and floor to ceiling, from concept to 
completion whether the task is small projects or mega proj-
ects.
 Among the many services Elite offers to clients.

Interior design consulting services:
It includes providing consulting services and solutions related 
to the creation and development of interior designs for com-
mercial spaces such as hotels, offices, hospitals, restaurants, 
shops, schools or any other structural spaces such as exhibi-
tions. This includes selecting and coordinating color schemes, 
paints, floors, ceilings, fixtures, lighting, furnishings and interi-
or decor.

Internal execution services, 
   Luxurious finishes guaranteed for Elite customers, including 
the implementation of selected designs for gypsum work, 
partitions, Curtains, paints, flooring, ceilings, all fixtures,
lighting,  furnishings and all kinds of  interior decoration.

Services
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Project management consultancy:
Includes companies specialized in managing and directing 
project operations from start to finish with regard to planning, 
organizing, motivating, controlling resources and procedures 
in order to achieve all project objectives, and includes manag-
ing budgets, resources and relationships to achieve organiza-
tional goals, planning and establishing schedules to ensure 
timely completion of projects

We are backed by prominent suppliers all over the world.
Ensure that all client requirements are efficiently met.
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Executed projects
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Millenium Hotel, Abu Dhabi

The Ritz-carlton Hotel, Al Wadi. R.A.K 

Al Habtoor Polo Resort Hotel - Dubai

Royal Jordanian Office, Dubai

Rotana Hotels & Resorts, Dubai

Angsana Hotel & Spa , Dubai

Smiths Detection – Airport Free Zone, Dubai

Banyan Three (Al Wadi) Resort, R.A.K.

Mawlawiyah Restaurant, Marina Dubai

The Veranda Restaurant

Taim Oak Hotel – Dubai

Rak National Hotels LLC

Lokmat Gibran Restaurant – Dubai

Naanaa Restaurant, Dubai

Pak Oasis Office – Tecom

Water Bike Beauty Center-Dubai

 Level Stare Restaurant – Dubai

Ras Al Khaimah Tourism Development Authority

Executed projects
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